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29 May 2019 
 
 

Freedom of Information Request – Ref: FOI 027-1920 
 

Thank you for your recent Freedom of Information request about the support offered to 
homeless patient. Please find our response below. 
 

1) How many attendances to your organisation were coded as NFA (no fixed address) per year in 

2015, 2016, 2017, and 2018? 

 

The Trust does not hold this information. 
 

2) Does your organisation have (a) a documented pathway for supporting homeless patients; or (b) a 

housing officer (or similar); or (c) a supply of clean clothes to offer homeless people? If yes to (a), 

(b), or (c) please provide details. 

(a) We  would refer to the appropriate District Council for housing and 
support. We are  currently running a pilot in conjunction with a Housing 
Association to strengthen our approach and to specifically avoid 
homeless discharges. 

(b) We are funded to provide a Support Accommodation Team which has 
access to 130 beds for use in supporting patients flowing through our 
services.  The service also has strong links with our District Council 
housing colleagues so that we also have appropriate access to their 
housing stock. 

(c) All of our wards have a supply of clean clothes in various sizes which 
are provided to service users as appropriate. 

 

3) How many patient referrals to a local housing authority under the Homelessness Reduction Act 

2017 has your organisation made since 1 October 2018? 

 

The Trust does not hold this information. 
 

4) What is your organisation doing, or planning to do, to support homeless patients or to comply with 

the Homelessness Reduction Act 2017? 

 

Our Supported Accommodation Team supports people or advises teams on 
registering an individual as homeless when required to do so. 
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Yours sincerely, 
 

Francis Perrin 
 
FRANCIS PERRIN 
Trust Secretariat Support Officer 
2gether NHS Foundation Trust 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 

Copyright & Reuse of Public Sector Information  

The information and material that is routinely published is subject to 2gether NHS Foundation Trust's 
copyright unless otherwise indicated. Unless expressly indicated on the material to the contrary, it may be 
reproduced free of charge in any format or medium, provided it is reproduced accurately and not used in a 
misleading manner.  Where any of the copyright items are being re-published or copied to others, you must 
identify the source of the material and acknowledge the copyright status. Permission to reproduce material 
does not extend to any material accessed through the Trust website that is the copyright of third parties. 
You must obtain authorisation to reproduce such material from the copyright holders concerned. For further 
guidance on a range of copyright issues, see the Office of Public Sector Information (OPSI) web site: 
www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/crown-copyright/copyright-guidance/index.htm 

or write to: OPSI, 102 Petty France, London SW1H 9AJ. 
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