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Thank you for your recent Freedom of Information request about restraint.   Please find the 
Trust’s response below. 

1. number of  admissions (formal and informal) to psychiatric facilities;  See table below. 

2. number of  restraints;  

644 PMVA/PBM incidents recorded in 12 the months April to March 2016/17 

3. number of restraints per 100 admissions per month;  See table below. 

4. patients affected by restraint per 100 admissions per month;  The Trust does not hold this 

information. 
5. events per 100 occupied bed days per month; See table below. 

6. events per 100,000 population per year;  The Trust does not hold this information. 

7. patients affected by restraint per 100 occupied bed days per month;  The Trust does not hold this 

information. 
8. average number of restraints per affected patients;  The Trust does not hold this information. 

9. percentage of patients exposed to restraint and seclusion; The Trust does not hold this information. 

 

  

Question 1 

Admissions 
Question 2 

PMVA/PBM 

incidents 

Question3 

PMVA/100 

Admissions 

Question 5 

PMVA/100 

Occupied 

Bed Days 

Apr-16 97 41 42.27 0.72 

May-16 93 67 72.04 1.12 

Jun-16 93 69 74.19 1.25 

Jul-16 107 67 62.62 1.22 

Aug-16 93 20 21.51 0.38 

Sep-16 101 52 51.49 0.94 

Oct-16 110 48 43.64 0.82 

Nov-16 88 53 60.23 0.93 

Dec-16 82 43 52.44 0.74 

Jan-17 90 41 45.56 0.72 

Feb-17 69 72 104.35 1.43 

Mar-17 94 71 75.53 1.38 

Total  644     

 

Yours sincerely, 
 

Lisa Evans 
LISA EVANS 
Information Governance Officer 
2gether NHS Foundation Trust 

mailto:2gnft.Information-Freedom@nhs.net
http://www.2gether.nhs.uk/


 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 

Copyright & Reuse of Public Sector Information  

The information and material that is routinely published is subject to 2gether NHS Foundation Trust's 
copyright unless otherwise indicated. Unless expressly indicated on the material to the contrary, it may be 
reproduced free of charge in any format or medium, provided it is reproduced accurately and not used in a 
misleading manner.  Where any of the copyright items are being re-published or copied to others, you must 
identify the source of the material and acknowledge the copyright status. Permission to reproduce material 
does not extend to any material accessed through the Trust website that is the copyright of third parties. 
You must obtain authorisation to reproduce such material from the copyright holders concerned. For further 
guidance on a range of copyright issues, see the Office of Public Sector Information (OPSI) web site: 
www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/crown-copyright/copyright-guidance/index.htm 

or write to: OPSI, 102 Petty France, London SW1H 9AJ. 

http://www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/crown-copyright/copyright-guidance/index.htm

