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Thank you for your recent Freedom of Information request. Please find the Trust’s

response below.
1. How much does it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one doctor from an EEA country, as of October
2018? The Trust does not hold this information.

2. How much does it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one nurse from an EEA country, as of October
2018? The Trust does not hold this information.

3. How much did it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one doctor from an EEA country in October 20157
The Trust does not hold this information.

4. How much did it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one nurse from an EEA country in October 2015?
The Trust does not hold this information.

5. How much of 2Gether NHS Foundation Trust’s overall budget is dedicated to recruitment? The
Advertising & Staff Recruitment budget is £79,140

6. How much did 2Gether NHS Foundation Trust spend on medicines from the EEA in 2015? The Trust
does not hold this information.

7. How much is 2Gether NHS Foundation Trust projecting to spend on medicines from the EEA in 2018?
The Trust does not hold this information.

8. What percentage of medication came from the EEA in 2015? The Trust does not hold this
information.

9. What percentage of medication came from the EEA in 2018? The Trust does not hold this
information.

Yours sincerely,

a%d/ %Zfa//z»j

LISA EVANS
Information Governance Officer
2gether NHS Foundation Trust

Copyright & Reuse of Public Sector Information

The information and material that is routinely published is subject to ?gether NHS Foundation Trust's
copyright unless otherwise indicated. Unless expressly indicated on the material to the contrary, it may be
reproduced free of charge in any format or medium, provided it is reproduced accurately and not used in a
misleading manner. Where any of the copyright items are being re-published or copied to others, you must
identify the source of the material and acknowledge the copyright status. Permission to reproduce material
does not extend to any material accessed through the Trust website that is the copyright of third parties.
You must obtain authorisation to reproduce such material from the copyright holders concerned. For further
guidance on a range of copyright issues, see the Office of Public Sector Information (OPSI) web site:
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